Engineering & Public Works

301 University Ridge, Suite 8-3000
Greenville, 8. C. 29601

Phone (864) 467-4612, Fax (864) 467-7161

C County of Greenville

Greenville

County APPLICATION FOR COUNCIL GRANT ASSISTANCE
WITH LIFE SAFETY WATER LINE INSTALLATION

Greenville County Enginesring & Public Works will take applications for Council Grant Agsistance with Life Safety
Water Line Installation. Applications will be based on health and life safety issues that include contaminated/non-
potable wells, dry wells and fire protection. Applications will be reviewed and scored by the Assistant County
Administrator for Public Works and the Engineering & Maintenance Division for completeness and criteria and will
be submitied to Roads, Infrastructure and Public Works Committee for consideration on a first come, first serve
basis.

This is a 50/50 grant program; therefore, the County of Greenville, upon approval by County Council, will provide
50% and the applicant will provide the other 50% for the installation of the water main and/or fire hydrant down the
public road. The applicant has 60 days to secure their portion of the funding and remit to the County of Greenville.
The respective property owners are responsible for the tap/meter fee and connection to the dwelling.
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rrom: Hank Tavior

zent: Fridav. September 29, 2023 9:59 AM
To: 47linled@gmail.com

Subject: Fwd: Well inspection letter revised

Tavylor's Plumbing and Sepfic LLC
178 Freeman Bridee Rd

SC Business License - RBP 218

Sentember 29, 2022

o Whom It Mav Concerii,

Upon inspection of the well locatec at 4014 Blue Ridge Circle, Greer, $C, home of Arthur and Linda
Ledford, it was determined to be insufficient to sustain their needs. The well is dry. Please calt owne.

Jincereiy,

Taylor's Plumbing and Septic LLC
Office - 864 634-0055

ffffff Forwaraed messase
From: Hank Tavior < >
Date: Fri, Sep 29, 2023, 9:42 AV
Subiect: Well inspection letter
To: <
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Tavior's Plumbing and Septic LLC

Marietta. 5C 29661



Greenville Maps

ge Circle
063505010280 06350507 0635050100000

1142123, 12:58 PM

063505002500 635050 102700]

06350, 0,0.16,40) b ) m D
| w0 1 SO 35050700800
! 06350 " |

@l
¥ o ‘ o~
06 35050103400 N \
! B\ , 0635050103100 0635050400700

GRS~ 1063505070350 A AR X
; | " X

214} " B06350501037000 -1

i ' @ 1

(063503010,200) A ) : —-h
E ' m ": P
| e - b 8 ;l 0635050400500

| ' 1406

0635030401400 06 35050105500 e~ . | | 205 B ._
y ?.. | 0635050;1038008 06350501040 0635050,100500,

" , 063505041037,00
U AIII0635050;1036000 -
0635030;101 2009 |

o

0635050100400,

BEVERLY.RDL ™

'\ RER | A
3 635050100100 0635050100200
© | II

0634020103003
2217/
0634020103002;
2219

0634020,103000, E-EEB \

,*3;&1 “#

06340201[}290!

g AN .
06350301102400 > 05340?010@70 i
063402012902 R

Disclaimer: This Map is not ¢ LAND SURVEY and is for reference purposes only. Dala contained in

this map are prepared for the inventory of Real Property found within this Jurisdiction, and are Map Scale

compilied from recorded deeds, plats, and other public records. Users of this map are hereby notified 1 inch = 267 feet
Syt aforementioned public primary information sources should be consulted for verification of the 11/2/2023

information contained in this map. Greenville County assumes no legal responsibility for the

information contained in this map.
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Gamble, Hesha

From: Brad Powers <bpowers@brrwc.org>
Sent: Monday, September 18, 2023 9:11 AM
To: Gamble, Hesha

Subject: RE: 4114 Blue Ridge Circle

CAUTION: This email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this sender before clicking on any
links or attachments.

Hesha,
Mr. & Mrs. Ledford, 4014 Blue Ridge Cir. Greer SC, 864-895-3193
BRRWC Tap Fee cost is $3,375

Thank you,

Brad Powers
Generai Manager / CO0
Blue Ridge Rural Water Co.. Inc.

Office (864) 895-1719
Fax 864} 895-7152
WWW.BRRWC.ORG
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Blue Ridge Rural Water Company

Notice: This electranic mail transmission and any attachment to it, has been scanned by an antivirus program, but in order to protect
your system BRRWC recommends that you conduct an independent virus scan. Afl contents within this transmission are privileged
and confidential information intended only for the personal and confidential use of recipient designated above. If you are not the
intended recipient of this communication, or the empioyee or agent responsible for delivering it to the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any review, disclosure, copying, distribution or use of the contents of this information is strictly prohibited. if
you have received this communication in errar, please immediately notify the sender and destroy the original message and all

copies. BRRWC Thanks you.
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From: Gamble, Hesha <HGamble@greenvillecounty.org>
Sent: Friday, September 15, 2023 1:28 PM



